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 ROLE OF PSYCHOSOCIAL FACTORS IN VICARIOUS TRAUMATIZATION: 
A COMPARATIVE STUDY 

Hina Iqbal2 Nazia Mustafa , 1 

ABSTRACT: 

OBJECTIVES: 

The present study aimed at investigating the role of psychosocial factors such as, gender, marital status, 

profession, and personal history of trauma in vicarious traumatization (VT). 

METHODOLOGY: 

Cross sectional study was conducted at various hospitals in Rawalpindi and Islamabad over the period of 6 

months from January 2018 to June 2018. A sample of 170 healthcare professionals (doctors=39, 

psychiatrists=27, psychologists=36, nurses=30 and others=38) (men=67, women=103) was taken from various 

hospitals in Rawalpindi and Islamabad. Data were collected by using the Secondary Traumatic Stress Scale.  

RESULTS: 

Results revealed significant differences have been found among various groups of healthcare professionals 

(doctors, psychiatrist, psychologists, nurses and others) in whom psychiatrists are the most vulnerable group for 

vicarious traumatization and psychologists are the least vulnerable group. Moreover, healthcare professionals 

who are married and have personal history of trauma are more vulnerable for vicarious traumatization as 

compared to those who are unmarried and without personal history of trauma. No significant gender differences 

have been found among health care professionals on vicarious traumatization. 

CONCLUSION: 

The findings of present research have emphasized that vicarious traumatization must be addressed and identified 

in a health setting. 
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INTRODUCTION:  

The traumatic events often have devastating impacts 
on health and community and along with primary 
victims; individuals who are involved in assisting 

them are also at risk of developing stress related 

trauma1. This phenomenon is known as vicarious 
trauma and it brings changes in psychological, 
physical, and spiritual well-being of professionals 
and affects their family relations and coping 

symptoms because of the contagious nature of 

traumatization

strategies negatively2. These professionals include 
medical personnel, armed forces personnel, rescue 
workers, fire safety workers, mental health 
professionals and social workers. These all people 
are at risk for the growth of vicarious 

3,4. Many researches have been 
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traumatization among individuals from different 
work settings. It is found that about 10 percent of 

these personnel get affected and 30% reported post-
traumatic symptoms at high levels. A study showed 
high prevalence of vicarious traumatization among 
social workers after 20 months of terrorist attack on 
World Trade Centre5. Similar results were found for 
humanitarian aid workers in India and 8% of them 
met the criteria of PTSD6. Many other studies have 
been carried out with therapists, counselors, social 
workers and nurses with similar findings7. Many 
psychosocial factors such as gender, profession, 
marital status and past history of trauma play 
significant roles in the emergence of VT. Females 
are more vulnerable for trauma in general and for 
VT specifically8. In a research study, 56 females 
were studied who are wives of war veterans. Results 
asserted that 32 had six or more symptoms of 
secondary traumatic stress whereas only 3 had none 
of the symptoms. Twenty-two women met the 
diagnostic criteria for secondary traumatic stress. 
Furthermore, these women with VT were married 
longer than those without it9.  According to 
Pearlman and Paula, trauma therapists with a 
personal trauma history are more vulnerable for the 
development of VT as they have more negative 
effects from the work than those without a personal 
history10. Though, there are many researchers 
conducted in various parts of the world showing the 
high prevalence of vicarious traumatization among 
all those who are working with traumatized 
individuals11,12. Simultaneously, there is literature, 
which does not support this hypothesis that trauma 
affects others13. This situation creates the need to see 
what factors play a role in the emergence of VT. So 
present research is designed with the aim to see the 
role of psychosocial variables such as gender, 

 marital status, profession and personal history of 
trauma in vicarious traumatization.  

METHODOLOGY:   

Present study was designed to investigate the role of 
psychosocial factors (gender, marital status, personal 
history of trauma and profession) on the occurrence 
of vicarious trauma among health care professionals 
who are working with traumatized individuals. A 
sample of 170 healthcare professionals (men=67, 
women=103) with mean age of 31 years (range of 19 
to 51 years) was taken from various private/public 
sector hospitals in Rawalpindi and Islamabad 
through purposive sampling technique. Among these 
professionals 39 were doctors and 27 psychiatrists, 
36 were psychologists, 30 were nurses and 30 were 
other professionals. After obtaining their consent 
they were asked to fill Socio-Demographic Form 
and the Secondary Traumatic Stress Scale (STSS), 
which is designed to specifically measure secondary 
trauma symptoms. It is a 17-item Likert-type 
response format ranging from 1 (never) to 5 (very 
often) instrument with its reliability is 0.94 for full 
scale and the Intrusion, Avoidance, and Arousal 
subscales had alphas of 0.83, 0.89, and 0.85, 
respectively14. Socio-Demographic Form is 
developed to measure the psychosocial factors in 
which participants were asked about information 
regarding sex, age, marital status, profession and 
personal history of trauma. The data was entered on 
SPSS-24 and analyzed. Descriptive statistics were 
carried out to describe the mean, SD, frequencies 
and reliability coefficients. Further inferential 
statistics involved ANOVA and t-test to compare the 
mean differences of various groups. 

RESULTS: 

Results showed that the age of participants was 
between the range of 19 to 51 years (Mean=31.74, 
SD=6.74) and Secondary Traumatic Stress Scale 
(STSS) (r=0.92) was a reliable measure for the 
assessment of VT. 

 

Table 1: Means and Standard Deviations of Different Variables (n=170 )  
Variables  Mean  SD  

Vicarious Traumatization  42.62  11.77  

Intrusion  11.82  3.28  

Avoidance  17.84  5.34  

Arousal
 

12.96
 

4.21
 

Age
 

31.74
 

6.74
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Table 2: Marital Status Difference in Vicarious Traumatization (VT)  
 Married   Unmarried       

 (n=103)   (n=67)    95% CI  Cohen’s d  
Variables  Mean  SD   Mean  SD  T  

p
 LL  UL  

Intrusion 
 12.48

 
3.11

 
10.80

 
3.32

 
3.40

 
.001

 .68
 
2.66

 
.52

 
Avoidance 

 19.12
 

4.96
 

15.79
 

5.34
 

4.13
 
.000

 1.73
 

4.91
 

.65
 

Arousal
 

14.01
 

3.90
 

11.30
 

4.18
 

4.28
 
.000

 
1.46

 
3.96

 
.67

 
VT

 
45.60

 
10.86

 
37.89

 
11.74

 
4.36

 
.000

 
4.21

 
11.20

 
.72

 

          

 

 

 

 

 
Table 3: Difference on Personal History of Trauma

 

(PHT)

 

in Vicarious Traumatization

 

(VT)

 
 

With PHT

  

Without PHT

      

 

(n=124)

  

(n=46)

   

95% CI

 

Cohen’s d

Variables

 

Mean

 

SD

  

Mean

 

SD

 

T

 

p

 

LL

 

UL

 Intrusion 

 

12.60

 

2.98

 

9.73

 

3.15

 

5.44

 

.000

 

1.83

 

3.91

 

.93

Avoidance 

 

19.48

 

4.70

 

13.44

 

4.36

 

7.51

 

.000

 

4.45

 

7.62

 

1.33

Arousal

 

14.02

 

3.83

 

10.11

 

3.90

 

5.84

 

.000

 

2.59

 

5.23

 

1.01

VT 46.11 10.34 33.29 10.23 7.14 .000 9.27 16.37 1.24

     

 

 

     

Table 4: Gender Difference in Vicarious Traumatization (VT)

 
 

Male

  

Female

      

 

(n=67)

  

(n=103)

   

95% CI

 

Cohen’s d

 

Variables

 

Mean

 

SD

  

Mean

 

SD

 

T

 

p

 

LL

 

UL

 

Intrusion 

 

11.81

 

3.06

 

11.83

 

3.43

 

-.037

 

.970

 

-1.039

 

1.000

 

-.006

 

Avoidance 

 

18.30

 

4.73

 

18.30

 

5.70

 

.912

 

.363

 

-.890

 

2.419

 

0

 

Arousal

 

13.31

 

4.76

 

12.74

 

4.04

 

.871

 

.385

 

-.729

 

1.880

 

.12

 

VT 43.42 11.15 42.10 12.18 .714 476 -2.331 4.972 .11

.

 
 

  

  

  

  

  

   

   

       

 

 

 

 

 

 

          

          

 
 

Variable  Doctors  
(n=39)  

Psychiatrists  
(n=27)  

Psychologists  
(n=36)  

 

Nurses  
(n=30)  

Others  
(n=38)  

   
95% CL

 
Mean

 
SD

 
Mean

 
SD

 
Mean

 
SD

 
Mean

 
SD

 
Mean

 
SD

 
F

 
i-j

 
Mean D

 (i-j)

 

SE LL UL

 VT

 

43.49

 

13.14

 

49.56

 

9.73

 

36.36

 

12.37

 

41.30

 

11.60

 

43.76

 

7.83

 
 5.70**

 
 

Doctors-
Psychiatrists

 

-6.07*

 

2.795 -11.59 -.55

            

Doctors-
Psychologists

 

7.13*

 

2.580 2.03 12.22

            

Psychiatrists-
Psychologists

 

13.19*

 

2.842 7.58 18.81

            

Psychiatrists-
Nurses

 

8.256*

 

2.961 2.41 14.10

            

Psychiatrists-
Others

 

5.79*

 

2.810 .24 11.34

Psychologists-
Others

-7.40* 2.596 -12.53 -2.28

Table 5: Mean Differences of Groups of Health Care Professionals on Vicarious Traumatization (N=170)

Significant level reported: between group df=4, within group df=165, group total df=169, *p<.05, **p<.01
 

DISCUSSION:  

There is a series of major natural disasters such as 
earthquakes, floods etc. that have occurred in the 
world in the last few years. Unfortunately, the 
focus was on Asia, which suffered a lot15,16. On the 
other hand, most wars, insurgencies and terrorist 
attacks take place in Muslim world3. Pakistan is the 
country which faced all types of disasters. Health 
care professionals are individuals who help these 

 

     
 victims. These individuals come across extreme 

human suffering and observe the emotions of fear, 
helplessness and horror on a consistent basis. This 
may lead to increased likelihood of experiencing a 
change in their own psychological functioning17. 
So the present study was designed to find out the 
role of various psychosocial factors in VT among 
healthcare professionals in Pakistan. During 
disaster situations in Pakistan, a therapist himself 
became a victim of psychological suffering while 
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working with sufferers2. Comparison of 
psychosocial factors such as gender, marital status, 
profession and personal history of trauma were 
computed on the variable of VT and its 
components (intrusion, avoidance and arousal). 
Because these are important factors related to VT 
in previous literature. It is reported that married 
females are more vulnerable for VT9. A study 
found out that personal trauma history correlated 
with secondary trauma symptoms18. Results of 
present study show similar findings with previous 
literature. Results revealed significant differences 
have been found among various groups of 
healthcare professionals (doctors, psychiatrist, 
psychologists, nurses and others) in whom 
psychiatrists are the most vulnerable group for 
vicarious traumatization and psychologists are the 
least vulnerable group. Moreover, healthcare 
professionals who are married and have personal 
history of trauma are more vulnerable for vicarious 
traumatization as compared to those who are 
unmarried and without personal history of trauma. 
No significant gender differences have been found 
among health care professionals on vicarious 
traumatization. 

CONCLUSION: 

The findings of present research have emphasized 
that vicarious traumatization must be addressed 
and identified in a health setting. However, due to 
the relatively small sample size as well as the non-
probability convenience sampling method used, the 
sample is not representative of the general 
population. It is recommended that the present 
study be replicated in the future with larger and 
more representative samples so that the results can 
be generalized. 
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